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    01. I Ain't Superstitious  02. Close Together  03. Love Doctor  04. Don't Lie To Me  05. Take
These Chains  06. I'm A Bluesman  07. All Over Now  08. Hey Gypsy  09. Looking Tired  10.
Blackout Blues  11. Pills and Booze  12. Don't Tell Me What to Do  13. Evill    Alfie
Falckenbach: vocals  Paul "Shorty" Van Camp: guitar  Thomas Vanhaute: guitar  Frans
Ruzicka: bass  Georges Milikan: drums    

 

  

Unapologetically rooted in the British Blues-Rock boom of the late 60's and 70s, steeped in the
tradition of Leslie West's Mountain, The Jeff Beck Group and early Led Zeppelin, Blues Karloff
explore the outer reaches of the sounds that shaped this musical era. On their debut album
Ready For Judgement Day, which was released in October 2014, the band saluted some of the
Blues legends that every member of Blues Karloff had been listening to since childhood. The
album featured songs by Robert Johnson, Jimmy Reed, John Lee Hooker, Albert King, Howlin'
Wolf, and Muddy Waters; vintage Blues gems revisited, like the British Blues-Rock greats such
The Yardbirds, The Pretty Things, Savoy Brown, John Mayall and his Bluesbreakers and
Fleetwood Mac did back in the sixties and seventies; blistering interpretations of classic Blues
anthems reinterpreted in their own distinctive fashion, introducing a contemporary flavour to the
genre. The album was all about the influences; Black and White, British and American, that
shaped the musical tastes of the band members in their youth. Blues Karloff then road-tested
material for their second album, which they started recording in February, and finished early
September 2015. The band again revisited and remodelled both classic and lesser-known
tracks by the likes of Willie Dixon, Jimmy Reed, Bobby Womack, and Tom Hambridge (who has
been referred to as The White Willie Dixon by Rock and Roll Hall of Fame Inductee Buddy
Guy). They also recorded their version of Looking Tired a great Jagger-Richards Blues number
which the Rolling Stones originally recorded in 1965 during the sessions for the Out of Our
Heads album at RCA Studios in Hollywood, but which until today remains officially unreleased.
The remainder of the tracks on Light And Shade are songs written by various members of the
band themselves, sensing the need to gradually carve out their own identity as well as
demonstrating their developing skills as tunesmiths. ---Editorial Reviews, amazon.com

  

 1 / 2



Blues Karloff - Light And Shade (2015)

Written by bluesever
Monday, 18 January 2016 17:01 - 

download (mp3 @320 kbs):

  

yandex 4shared mega mediafire zalivalka cloudmailru oboom uplea 

  

 

  

back

  

 2 / 2

https://yadi.sk/d/CNCIYyBVnC6af
http://www.4shared.com/zip/49-K6F9Kce/BlsKrlf-LaS15.html
https://mega.nz/#!ucJVBY5L!QCoYBKCEq-PyZ5bX_gwrP5MAGan7C9RoW4hXHblXTnE
http://www.mediafire.com/download/yfiun4dtx13xqej/BlsKrlf-LaS15.zip
http://zalivalka.ru/335261
https://cloud.mail.ru/public/5D6H/y4tztvpxj
https://www.oboom.com/PP2BH29T/BlsKrlf-LaS15.zip
http://uplea.com/dl/90394BAC08BD811
javascript:history.back();

